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Ballerina Bees
by Abbie Williamson

aged 9 from Holm Cultram Abbey School

Good news, the 
Skinburness Hotel has 
been repossessed and has 
now been made secure 
prior to being put up for 
sale.

The Save Our 
Skinburness committee 
are still fighting the 
outline planning 
application, which is at 

appeal. In addition, a 
member of Skinburness 
Residents Association 
sent a letter to Prince 
Charles through the 
Association. The 
Prince of Wales then 
consulted other bodies 
such as SAVE Britain’s 
Heritage and has stated 
his concern about the 

state of the Hotel and the 
development plans.

His Royal Highness 
states that he is fully in 
support of our campaign.

This landmark 
building has so very 
much going for it, we can 
only hope that it gets the 
owner it needs when it is 
finally sold.

Flyin Ryan
coming to

Kite Festival

Skinburness Hotel

28th to 29th July
Silloth Kite Festival
4th to 5th August
Solway Food & 
Drink  Festival

24th to 26th August
Solfest

27th August
Silloth Carnival

27th August
Free Pop Concert
6th to 9th September
Silloth Music & 
Beer Festival
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